(Shipping Wing)

New Delhi, the 18th January, 1991

(Merchant Shipping)

G.S.R. 70- In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (2) of section 87 read with section 83 of the Merchant Shipping Act, 1958 (44 of 1958), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Merchant Shipping  (Examination of Engine Drivers of Sea-Going ships) Rules, 1973, namely.

1. (1) These rules may be called the Merchant Shipping (Examination of Engine Drivers of Sea-going Ships) Amendment Rules 1991.

(2) They shall come into force on the expiry of a period of six months from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Merchant Shipping (Examination of Engine Drivers of Sea-Going Ships) Rules, 1973.-

(1) In rule 5. after clause (d) the following clause shall be added, namely:-

“ (e) have successfully completed an approved Basic- Fire-Fighting Course.”

(2) In rule 6 for the proviso and Explanation to sub-rule (1) the following shall be    

      substituted, namely :-

“Provided that a candidate who has successfully completed a minimum three year Diploma Level Course in Marine Engineering or Mechanical Engineering recognised by the Ministry of Human Resources development or a State government, shall be required to perform only one year of workshop service.”

(3)
 In clause (a) of sub-rule (1) of rule 7 after the words and comma “engine driver” the words and comma “assistant fitter”, shall be inserted.

(4) 
In rule 8, for the word “and” the word “or” shall be substituted.

(5) 
In rule 12, for sub-rule (1) the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely :-

“(i)
remission upto a period of Nine months in workship service and four months in sea service shall be granted to all candidates who elect to appear for the written part of the examination in accordance with rule 36”.

(6) 
In rule 16.-

(a)
In the heading after the words “fishing Vessels”, comma and words “Off shore supply vessels” shall be inserted,

(b) 
in sub-rule (1) after the words “fishing Vessels” the following shall be inserted, namely :-

“Off-shore supply vessels or other similar self propelled vessels engaged in Oil exploration”;

(c) 
In Sub-rule (2) for the words “One half” the words “three fourth” shall be substituted.

(7) 
In rule 19, after sub-rule (4) the following proviso shall be added, namely :-

“Provided that where it is not practicable for a candidate to obtain the testimonials, the examiner may assess the service on the basis of entries made in continuous discharge certificate or some other reliable documents containing the requisite information.”

(8) 
In rule 25, for the word and figures “Rs. 25” the word and figures “Rs. 100” shall be substituted.

(9) 
In rule 28, for the word “ten”the word “twenty-five” shall be substituted.

(10) 
In rule 31,-

(a)
for the word and figure “Rs.5”, the word and figures “Rs.25” shall be substituted:

(b) 
for the word and figure “Re.1” the word and figures “Rs.25” shall be substituted.

(11) 
For rule 36,the following rule shall be substituted,namely:-

“36. Nature of examination: The candidate shall have the option of selecting one of the following two systems of examination, namely :-

(a)
Viva-voce examination in Engineering Knowledge for motor or steam or combined steam and motor.

OR

(b)
(i) 
One written paper of three hours duration in General engineering    

                  
science and 

(ii) 
One written paper of three hours duration in Engineering Knowledge for motor or steam, or 

(iii) 
Two papers in Engineering knowledge of three hours each for combined steam and motor, and 

(iv)
Viva-voce examination in Engineering Knowledge for Motor or steam or combined steam and motor.”

(12)
 For “APPENDIX-D,” the following shall be substituted,namely:- 

APPENDIX ‘D’

(See rule 37)

Syllabus for Examination

Engineering Knowledge : Viva-voce and Written papers.

(a) Syllabus given in items 1 to 30,36 and 37 of this Appendix are for Viva-voce examination in Engineering for motor candidates appearing under clause (a) of rule 36:

(b) items 1 to 22 and 31 to 37 are for Viva-voce examination in Engineering Knowledge for steam candidates appearing under clause (a) of rule 36;

c) items 1 to 37 are for Viva-voce examination in Engineering Knowledge for CombinedSteam and Motor candidates appearing under clause (a) of rule 36;

(d) items 1 to4,6,8,10,11,13,14,15,17,18,23,25,26 and 27 are for written examinationnder sub-clause (ii) and (iii) of clause (b) of rule 36 and items 5,7,9,12,16,19,20,21,22,24,28,29,30,36 and 37 are for Viva-voce for Motor candidates appearing under sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of rule 36;

(e) items 1 to 4,6,8,10,11,13,14,15,17,18,31,32 and 33 are for written examination under sub-clause (ii) and (iii) of clause (b) or rule 36 and items 5,7,9,12,16,19,20,21,22,34,35,36 and 37 are for Viva=voce examination in engineering Knowledge for Steam candidates appearing under sub clause (iv) of clause (b) of rule 36;

(f) items 1 to 4,6,8,10,11,13,14,15,17,18,23,25,26,27,31,32 and 33 are for written examination under sub-clause (i) and (iii) of clause (b) of rule 36and items 5,7,9,12,16,19,20,21,22,24,28,29,30,34,35,36 and 37 are for Viva-voce Examination in Engineering Knowledge for Combined under sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of rule 36.

Question will be generally upto 750 KW Ship board machinery installation.

1. Ability to transmit information relating to machinery components by means of simple sketches and supplementary notes.

2. Methods of manufacture of various machinery components and physical properties of the materials commonly used.

3. Constructional details. principals involved and operation of pressure gauges. thermometerstank measuring devices, ammeters, voltmeters and other measuring instruments commonly used on board ships. 

4. Construction and arrangements of steering systems.

5. Care and maintenance of steering systems.

6. Working principles and constructional detail of pumps and general requirements of pumping systems,e.g. bilge,ballast,fresh water, sea water and other systems.

7. Care and maintenance of pumps and pumping systems.

8. working principles and constructional detailes of equipment.

9. Care and maintenance oily water separator equipment.

10.Working principles and constructional detaile of refrigerating machinery.

11.Lay out and working of various electric circuits including lighting circuit.

12.Safe and efficient operation, maintenance of electrical equipment.

13.Work related to dry-docking, including propeller, trail shaft,rudder, sea-connections,elements of ships construction.

14.Estiuation of fuel and water consumption for a given voyage;

15.Construction details of auxiliary boilers including firing arrangements and boiler mountings. Boiler water tenting and treatment.

16.Care and management of auxiliary boilers.

17.Constructional details of auxiliary diesel engines.

18.Construction of fire-fighting equipment.

19.Mainrenance and operation of fire-fighting equipment. Hire detection and monitoring.

20.Dangers of entering enclosed spaces. Precantions against explosions due to oil,coal or gases.

21.Danger of oil leakage, precautions while bunkering.

22.Operation of basic automatic control systems and alarm panels.

23.Working principles and constructional details marine diesel engines,gears,clutches and ancillary equipment.

24.Safe and efficient operation and maintenance of diesel engines.

25.Fuel oil,lubrocating oil and cooling systems of diesel engines together with ancillary systems including filters, pumps, heat exchasngers and controls.

26.Starting and reversing operations of diesel engines.

27.Working principles and constructional details of air compressors, air receivers and associated equipment.

28.Various, safety devices in diesel engine,including devices to avoid explosions in crankcases and starting air systems.

29.Testing and fault rectification of basic automatic control systems and alarm panels.

30.Assessment of engine power, the running adjustments to maintain performance.

31. Construction of steam turbines, including reduction gearing, boilers including mountings, steam plant used as prime movers. Lubricating oil systems in turbines, construction of boiler feed pumps and feed systems, Turbo generators. Operation and maintenance of reciprocating engines.

32. Various types of auxiliary steam engines and auxiliaries used on board-steam ships.

33. Forced draught, coal and oil burning system for boilers and prevention of smoke.

34. Safe and efficient operation and maintenance of steam turbines, boilers and reciprocating engines.

35. Safety devices associated with steam turbines, boilers and reciprocating steam engines.

36. Irregularities in the Performance of Machinery and the analysis and interpretation of information gained from monitoring equipment.

37. Knowledge of appropriate rules concerning to engine room personnel, administrative duties of an Engineer-in-charge of vessels of propulsion power of less than 350 kW including organisation and training of staff for normal and emergency duties, use of safety equipment, organisation of repairs and surveys and associated reports.

GENERAL ENGINEERING SCIENCE

The General Engineering Science paper shall be in two sections, namely A and B. Each section and pass in each section.

Section ‘A’

Kinemaics :

       Velocity, acceleration, curves of displacement, and velocity, falling bodies; vectors;  applications to velocities, relative velocity, angular displacement, velocity and acceleration.

The Laws of Motion.

         
First law, inertia, weight, momentum, second law, triangle and polygon of forces, impulse, the third law, motion of connected bodies and Atwood’s machine, Work, power and energy

         
Work, power, moment of a force, work of torque, energy-potential, kinetic and principle of work.

Motion in a Circle, Simple Harmonic Motion

Uniform Circular motion, Centripetal and Centrifugal force, curved track, conical pendulum, motion in vertical circle, simple harmonic motion and simple pendulum.

Statics :

Triangle and Polygon of forces, Parallel forces, moments,  moments of resultants, principle of moments, levers, couples, reduction of a coplaner system, conditions of equilibrium, smooth bodies, method of sections, equilibrium of three forces and Bow’s rotation.

Friction :

      
Friction, coefficient of friction, angle of friction, sliding friction, action of brakes, adhesion, friction of screw and inclined plane.

Centre of Gravity :

Properties of c.g., c.g. of distributing load, body resting on a plane, stable, unstable, neutral equilibrium and work done in lifting a body.

Stress and strains :

Direct stresses and strains, Hooks Law, ultimate tensible strength, factor of safety, modulus of Elasticity and tensile test.

Bending of Beams :

Conditions of equilibrium, simply supported beams and cantilevers concentrated and distributed loading, shearing force and bending moment diagram.

Torsion

Fundamental torsion equation, Relation between torque, stress and power.

Hydrostatics :

Liquids and fluid pressure, relation of pressure to depth in liquid, mercury barometer, pressure on submerged surface, centre of pressure liquid pressure on curved surfaces, density and specific gravity, flotation and buoyancy, conditions of equilibrium of floating body, partial immersion, constraints, principle of Archimedes, stability of floating body and metacentric height.

SECTION ‘B’

Heat :

Temperature and its measurement, absolute temperature, specific heat, mechanical equivalent, water equivalent, latent heat, fusion and evaporation.

Thermal Expansion :

Expansion of metals, linear, superficial and cubieal expansion, expansion of liquids.

Expansion and Compression of Perfect Gases :

Relationship between pressure, temperature and volume.

Internal Combustion Engines :

Cycles of operation, four-stroke and two stroke engines, indicator diagrams, mean effective pressure, indicated and brake power, mechanical efficiency.

Steam:

Properties of steam dryness fraction, superheated steam.

Compustion :

Principles of combustion, calorific value, air required for combustion.

[F No.. SR| 11012|2|90-MA]

K.PADMANABHACHAR, Under Secy.

Foot Note:

The Principal rules were published vide G.S.R. No. 1175 dated the 17th October, 1973.

Amended by :-

G.S.R No. 783 dated 12th May 1976.

MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT

(Shipping Wing)

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 27th April, 1993

G.S.R. 385(E). - In exercise of the powers conferred by Sub-Section (2) of section 87 read with section 83 of the Merchant Shipping Act, 1958 (44 of 1958), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Merchant Shipping (Examination of Engine Drivers of sea-Going Ships) Rules, 1973, namely :-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Merchant Shipping (Examination of Engine Drives of Sea-Goint Ships) Amendment Rules, 1992.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Merchant Shipping (Examination of Engine Drivers of Sea-Going Ships) Rules, 1973, “In Appendix ‘D’. -

(a) In para (d) in line 3, for “sub-clauses (ii) and (iii)”, “sub-clauses (i) and (iii)” shall be substituted :

(b) In para (e) in line 3, for “sub-clauses (ii) and (iii)”, “sub-clauses (i) and (ii), shall be substituted”,

 (F. No. SR-11012/2/90-MA)

P. K. DUBEY, Director

Foot Note :

The Principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide G.S.R. No. 1175 dated 17th October 1973 and subsequently amended by G.S.R. No. 783 dated 12th May 1976 and G.S.R. No. 70 dated 18th January 1991.

